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Hello. Lani with you again, today 
drawing you into the gathering, into 
that inner space where you connect 
very easily with the flows and 
energy fields around us all.  As you 
relax your body and breathe easily 
and naturally, then you become 
aware that you have your individual 
energy field. Are you aware of that? 

This energy field is a higher vibration frequency, the 
aspect of it that is that higher vibration frequency is 
what I am addressing you as and it is this aspect of 
you, your body intelligence and your light system of 
consciousness, this is what gathers in the receiving 
area of this Station of Light. Take a moment to feel 
that you are in this space.  

Perceive what is around you. Are you feeling the 
presence of other people like us?  

Are you feeling the presence of higher vibrational 
frequency Beings? It is all part of expanding your 
consciousness field into the higher vibrational 
fields. This is where we are at, in this moment, 
ready to receive energy and information from this 
quantum field of consciousness. 

 

 

 

 

“Orem greeting you in this space and indeed, as 
described, it is a quantum field containing many 
different aspects of your individual soul pattern and 
its experiences and many other information 
packets communicated through the matrix of 
cosmic intelligence. This overlays everything. This 
is permanently in place everywhere that is creation 
from the quantum field. This is where you are 
realizing the importance of your presence as you 
realise you are of the quantum substance of 
creation.  

In this context you are the substance of the 
quantum consciousness creative field. You are the 
manifestation of it and so everything that you have 
become aware of as your individual life pattern, this 
is a composite of the quantum intelligent creative 
field.  

You are conscious of this and so you can act 
individually and yet you are basically connected to 
a greater quantum field of intelligence.  

You choose the levels that you comfortably can 
function at and in that way you are able to expand 
that level of comfort, of recognition, into a greater 
field of consciousness often referred to as the edge 
of your consciousness. That is an interface aspect 
that you can be aware of but it still is receiving a 
quantum intelligent field. It extends and extends 
and extends beyond the simplicity and the 
complexity of your individual soul pattern as it is 
present in the current body form. 

This is how we begin this session today, for you to 
realise the expansiveness and what you truly are.  

You may also be observing from this point of view 
that there are different energy pockets surrounding 
your individual energy form and body form. We are 
referring to aspects that have got locked in, or 
perhaps entangled, in your energy field. These 
have created distraction points, detracting you from 
the original essence of the quantum field of 
creation. You will realise when you review earlier 
meeting up sessions in this space that there had 
been a continuation of clearance, release and 
expelling and dispelling of extraneous matter that 
had become caught in your energy field. It can get 
entangled in thought processes and then there is 
an aspect of the self-protection ability of the 
individual elements of you to protect itself and in so 
doing it incorporates the thought field or thought 
patterns that may have been improperly received 
or imposed upon you. We continue with this aspect 
of helping you to realise and to release the 
imposition of thoughts that have got entangled in 
your energy structure and that misinforms the 
energy structure and so the physical structure then 
seems to enhance and incorporate the mis-
informing pattern.  You will see the relationship 
between disturbances that occur in your energy 
field and your physicality field. They are detracting 
you from the original intention of your soul pattern. 

Even in speaking these words to you there is an 
energy field around you.   



 

You may feel that you have stepped into this energy 
field, and this incorporates the higher field to clear 
the misinformed patterns away from you. Following 
this, you are then communicating clearly and 
responding clearly and assisting clearly the 
quantum field of the Beings, the cosmic intelligent 
Beings, drawn into the exchange of information 
which is occurring to do with the planetoid named 
Earth where you are stationed. There are many 
individual Beings, all aspects of the cosmic creative 
field, working in harmony to balance and to restore 
the original intention and pattern for the existence 
of this world that has been created. Now you are 
able to incorporate within your presence as an 
individual Being in the current civilization the higher 
field.  

Already you may be aware there are matters being 
sorted out that do not matter, that are not of the 
matter that has been created from cosmic source 
in its original intention. As your lifespan continues 
you are absorbing the higher energy field to 
restructure everything that is to do with the 
intelligent systems for your presence in the 
continuation of it within the civilization. Indeed, you 
might say attention is focused on you as an 
individual and on all the individuals who are 
seriously committed to the prime source code of life 
and of the life of the planetoid itself. 

You are already aware that you consist of elements 
that are also the constitution of the planetoid and 
you are drawing consistently on that, you are 
drawing on the air, the vital elements of the earth, 
the planet life and the creatures. It is all one 
assembly, one composition of the life force and you 
receive the light, the rays of energy that are 
refreshing everything on the land in a cycle. It is one 
sense a one state, one constitutional effect and 
manifestation of the quantum intelligent creative 
field. You might be asking how does this relate to 
your individual life and experiences you are having. 
As you realise the experience needs to be fully 
engaging the support systems of the quantum 
intelligent field, then you see this reshapes your 
individual life pattern in the many ways you think 

about that as. This presentation to you is simple in 
that you are exposed to, you are immersed in, the 
original quantum pattern of creation. From this 
again as you connect to your original source code 
you are gathering in the creativeness. This comes 
forward in personal individual inspirational ideas 
and concepts and you will be putting those into 
reality in some way around you. This applies to all 
the activities around you in your life pattern.  

Simply put – are you creating harmony and a sense 
of clarity and connection to the greater field of 
information? Are you fully connected with that – 
fully aligned throughout all the elemental systems 
of your creation? This is what is required. That you 
allow this connection and alignment and 
information to be fully connected and flowing 
through you, everywhere through you. As you 
become aware of that you might become aware of 
pockets in your energy field or structure that are 
creating blockages, but as you realize those 
blockages are simply energy to be dissolved in the 
light systems you are receiving, this is the 
simplicity of your true vital energy essence and 
activity. The more you become aware of this as 
your body form intelligently connected to the 
cosmic field, then naturally there are adjustments 
occurring around you. It is the resonating effect that 
you have when you are correctly resonating with 
the prime source of creation. This is simplicity given 
to you in these worlds. This is you and this is you 
responding to the energy field here. You are 
immersed in this field. It is a way for you to present 
yourself into this field to continue this clearing 
pattern, so it gives you the opportunity to shift out 
of anything that is occurring that is subjecting you 
in your life or in the pattern of the planetoid life that 
is a limiting factor that had been created to be 
limiting you. This is the reminder to step out of that, 
allowing your consciousness to expand again into 
the prime source of creation. This is what you have 
drawn into you in this session. 

Orem out“ 

Thank you, Orem. Again, Lani with 
you, experiencing another shift, 
another expansion of what we have 
been realizing. Maybe there was a 
little shift that many of us were 
needing to make in our thought field 
affecting our constitution and all the 

elements of it. 

As you continue to unfold and receive what has 
been around you in this session, it will give rise to 
more inspiration with you, it is like the inspired 
breath that we take as part of inspiration / 
respiration and it is a full exchange of energy and 
information in and out. Again, it has been wonderful 
to deliver this through me and this Omega Portal to 
you and other ones you share it with. Perhaps you 
simply share it through a simple word you 
exchange with other people in your life pattern who 
may not be ready to understand your level of 
consciousness.  

This is what you have responded to in this session 
and this is already continuing the improvement, the 
clearance, allowing your presence to be clearer 
and stronger in the reality of the world you exist in 
and you are creating the reality around you.  Bring 
all of this into you now and be fully consciously 
present in the present time within your body field. It 
is a cosmic intelligent field that you are, the energy 
that your body is.  This is our session today. Enjoy 
it all.  

This ends this session through the Omega 
Communications Portal today. Thank you.  

Lani      
 舎舍 
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